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Prologue 
 
 
 Lightning streaked across a dark sky, illuminating the night as 
only the devil’s own torch could. Thunder reverberated through 
the heavy, moist air. Raindrops as big as quarters pelted the 
lone rider. The high plateaus of southern Wyoming offered no 
escape from the deluge. What Matt needed now was an 
overpass or an underpass—someplace to escape this torrential 
downpour. 
 Late summer thunderstorms were expected in this part of the 
country. During the winter, the blizzards blew across this 
highway with abandon. In the summer, the thunderstorms did the 
same. Matt knew he would not get a reprieve. This storm would 
have to be ridden out. Looking down at the wet, black ribbon of 
highway, with no overpasses, Matt accepted his fate. His 
destination awaited him fifty miles east. 
 Matt was not a tall man. He stood only five-foot-six inches tall. 
A narrow waist on top of heavily muscled legs supported his 
broad chest and thick shoulders. Arms that looked like tree limbs 
clung to the handlebars of a Harley that had been modified to fit 
his short stature. His pug nose lay almost flat against his face, 
lending testament to the many times it had been broken. 
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 Matt was a plumber by trade. He also coached the kids in his 
hometown. In the spring, he coached baseball. In the fall, he 
coached football. He taught the art of boxing throughout the 
year. His destination today: a Golden Gloves tournament in Rock 
Springs. 
 He had heard about a young man who had a left hook from 
hell. Add that to a vicious straight right, toss in some fancy 
footwork, and the mix was that of a champion. The young man 
won his last fifteen bouts by knockout. 
 Matt’s reason for traveling today was to film the kid’s fight. He 
would use it as a training film for his student. 
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